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Small slim woven baskets
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Oblong woven baskets made from four weaving paper
strips

Comment faire
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7   Now fold the base as shown in the
photo along all four edges.  

 

8   -   

9   Start with two of the corners. Hold
them in the same way as shown in
the photo.  

 

10   Always weave over and under. In
that way the paper strips lock
together.  

 

11   Tighten so the strips are adjacent
to each other.  

 

12   Take a strip from the right hand
side and weave it towards the left.  

 

13   Take a strip from the left hand
side and weave it towards the right.  

 

14   Attach a Glue Spot in order to
keep the two strips together.  

 

15   Cut off the end of the strip,
approx. 1cm from the edge of the
woven basket. Attach a Glue Spots
onto the small flap, fold it over and
secure it on the inside of the basket.  
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16   Repeat with all four sides. Make
sure to tighten the strips
continuously so ensure they are
always adjacent to each other.  

 

17   Cut off the end of the strips and
secure as described in step 15.  

 

18   Use one of the longest cut-off
strips as a handle and attach this to
the inside of the basket with Glue
Spots.  


